

**RICHARDSON ISD REQUEST FOR SEALED BID NUMBER 1408
DOORS AND ASSOCIATED HARDWARE**

	<u>ABC Doors of Dallas</u>	<u>Accredited Lock</u>	<u>Dallas Door/Supply</u>	<u>Fairway Supply</u>	<u>Won-Door Corp.</u>
1. Door, SL-15	No bid	No bid	\$1,652.00	\$1,961.00	No bid
2. Door, SL-17, dbl.	No bid	No bid	\$2,430.00	\$2,721.00	No bid
3. Door, SL-17, sgl.	No bid	No bid	\$1,050.00	\$1,462.00	No bid
4. Door, SL-17 6070 dbl	No bid	No bid	\$6,870.00	\$6,060.00	No bid
5. Door, SL-17 3070 sgl	No bid	No bid	\$3,695.00	\$3,914.60	No bid
6. Door, SL250 136x152	No bid	No bid	\$7,335.00	No bid	No bid
7. Door, SL250 223x112	No bid	No bid	\$12,065.00	No Bid	No bid
8. Door, SL250 76x101	No bid	No bid	\$7,036.00	No Bid	No bid
9. Door, SL250 186x113	No bid	No bid	\$7,335.00	No Bid	No bid
10. Pocket door 3070	No bid	No bid	\$1,790.00	\$1,955.14	No bid
11. Pocket door 4070	No bid	No bid	\$1,720.00	No Bid	No bid
12. Panels, 28x79x1/4	No bid	No bid	\$822.00	No Bid	No bid
HARDWARE DISCOUNTS:					
13. Arrow IC Cores	No bid	56%	10%	40%	No bid
14. Arrow Mortise	No bid	60%	29%	40%	No bid
15. Arrow Key Blanks	No bid	40%	10%	40%	No bid
16. Best IC Cores	No bid	55%	16-28%	50%	No bid
17. Best Mortise	No bid	55%	16-28%	50%	No bid
18. Best Key Blanks	No bid	55%	16-28%	40%	No bid
19. Falcon Mortise	No bid	55%	42%	40%	No bid
20. LCN Door Closers	No bid	56%	23%	40%	No bid
21. Norton Closers	No bid	60%	38%	50%	No bid
22. Roton Hinges	No bid	56%	40%	20%	No bid
23. Select Hinges	No bid	55%	30%	45%	No bid
24. Von Duprin Panic	No bid	56%	22%	40%	No bid
25. Yale Mortise	No bid	55%	29%	40%	No bid
DOOR PRODUCT LINES:					
26. Rolling Steel	Yes	No	No	No	No
27. Aluminum/Glass	No	No	Yes	No	No
28. Overhead	Yes	No	No	No	No

29. Door Closers	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	No
30. Fire Doors	Yes	No	Yes	Yes	Yes
31. Security Doors	Yes	No	No	No	No
32. Acoustical	Yes	No	Yes	No	Yes
33. Partition Doors	Yes	No	No	No	Yes
SERVICE:					
34. In-house staff	Yes	No	Yes	Yes	Yes
Labor rate/hour	\$122.00	N/A	\$125.00	\$105.00	N/A
Service hours	7:30-4:30	N/A	7:00-3:30	7:30-4:30	7:00-5:00
Delivery:					
35. Source	Company Fleet	UPS or Fedex	Company Fleet	UPS	Common Carrier
Delivery charge	None	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Del. Charge waived		over \$200.00	over \$250.00	over \$5,000.00	No
36. Payment Terms	Net 30	Net 30	2% 10 days, net 30	Net 30	Net 30