

Tabulation for RFP# 1482-Custodial Supplies and Related Items

Line Item Awarded Vendor (All vendors awarded for offline pricing with 1 exception)
 Eliminated from Award - low usage

Bid Line No.	Item	Selected	Lowest	All American Poly	American Pride Paper and Plastic	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	Byrne Brothers Foods, Inc.	Complete Supply Inc	Ecobal Inc.	Empire Paper	Evolve Pro Solutions, Inc.	GTE Holdings, LLC	Interboro Packaging Corporation	John M Baxter Sales	Matera Paper Company	Olmsted Kirk Equipment & Supply Co.	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	Pollock Paper Distributors	Prime Source	Safeway Supply, Inc	School Specialty Inc	Staples Business Advantage	Supplyworks	Veritiv Operating Company	Wedge Supply, LLC	Western BRW Paper Company
#0-1	WPES - Heavy Duty Wipes: Approximately 12" x 17". Packed 1/160 ct. in a pop-up dispenser box. Color Blue. Approved Brand: Kimberly Clark 44300	\$ 19.10	\$ 9.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.25	\$ 26.38	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.74
#0-2	BAGS - Size 40 - 45 gallon, black. Stretch-fit bag that will grip the top rim of can. GAUGE: 1.1 mil; SEAL: Star; PACK TYPE: Coreless roll; CURRENT PACK: 10 bag per roll, 10 rolls per case which equals 100 bags per case. (Prefer 15 to 20 bags per roll) Approved Brand: Berry Plastic SF49UNDB or equal.	\$ 12.75	\$11.70	\$ 12.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.00	\$ 11.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.88	No Bid	\$ 14.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.52	\$ 12.75	\$ 16.40	\$ 25.20	\$ 27.56	\$ 17.06	\$ 18.74	\$ 15.16	\$ 16.16
#0-3	BAGS - Size 13 gallon, clear. Stretch-fit bag that will grip the top rim of can. For Office Waste. GAUGE: .60 mil; SEAL: Star; PACK TYPE: Coreless roll; CURRENT PACK: 50 bag per roll; 10 rolls per case which equals 500 bags per case. Approved Brand: Berry Plastic SF13TOPFC or equal.	\$ 16.25	\$14.45	\$ 26.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.00	\$ 24.33	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.69	No Bid	\$ 17.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.13	\$ 16.25	\$ 14.45	No Bid	\$ 27.38	\$ 20.92	\$ 15.43	\$ 18.45	\$ 19.71
#0-4	BAGS - Size 12" x 15". Red Biohazard Bag; High Density, 1 mil. Must meet federal and state regulations for tear resistance of 480 grams (ASTM D1922) and impact resistance of 165 grams (ASTM D1709). Packed: 1,000 per case but would prefer 100 count. Approved Brand: MedBag, HD1215R or equal.	\$ 25.57	\$25.57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.21	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.57	\$ 93.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-5	BAGS - Size 55 gallon. Stretch-fit bag that will grip the top rim of can. GAUGE 1.3 mil; SEAL: Star; PACK TYPE: Coreless roll; CURRENT PACK: 10 bags per roll; 10 rolls per case which equals 100 bags per case. Approved Brand: Berry Plastic SF55ROUNDW or equal.	\$ 16.28	\$16.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-6	BROOMS - Maxi-Clean Angle, Flagged PET bristles, washable sanitary beige fibers, 48" lacquered hardwood handle, 12" sweeping surface. Approved Brand: NexStep 6400-W or equal.	\$ 5.25	\$ 3.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.89	No Bid	\$ 5.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.99	\$ 5.51	\$ 5.78	No Bid
#0-7	CAN, GARBAGE - Size 44 gallon, 24" in diameter; round design, molded of engineered resins w/ seamless construction. Heavy-duty handles. Double ribbed base for stability. Approved Brand: Rubbermaid "Brute" #2643, Contico Huskie 4444GY or Equal.	\$ 22.00	\$22.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.08	\$ 24.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.86	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.99	No Bid	\$ 26.00	No Bid	\$ 31.18	No Bid	\$ 26.38	No Bid	\$ 24.22	No Bid
#0-8	CAN, LIDS - To fit 44 gallon round design, 24-1/2" x 1 3/8" diameter, molded of engineered resins. Please bid lid to fit item 20042. Approved Brand: Rubbermaid "Brute" 2645, Contico 4445GY or equal.	\$ 6.25	\$ 6.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.45	\$ 7.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.07	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.79	No Bid	\$ 9.00	No Bid	\$ 13.57	No Bid	\$ 9.06	No Bid	\$ 8.67	No Bid
#0-9	DETERGENT LAUNDRY - Pre-measured, water-soluble laundry detergent packets. Non-phosphate and enzyme stain removing. To contain odor counteractant. For use with top and front loading washing machines. Biodegradable surfactants. Packed 250/1.2 oz packets per bucket. APPROVED BRAND: Ecobal 61502222 or equal.	\$ 52.03	\$52.03	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.03	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 173.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-10	DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL - Lever Action; Must be ADA compliant (Maximum 5 lbs downward pressure to operate). Holds 8" wide paper towel rolls. Surface Mounted; Metal construction (stainless steel preferred). Approximate dimensions 9 1/2" deep; 12 1/4" wide; 15" tall. Approved Brand: B-2860, American Specialties 8522, Palmer T215WH or Equal.	\$ 33.39	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 64.95	No Bid	\$ 43.61	No Bid	\$ 40.46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.34	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.39	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 33.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-11	DISPENSER TOILET TISSUE TWIN DISPENSER - Coreless JRT Twin Bath Tissue dispenser; Finish: Smoke/Grey Transparent high-impact plastic. Will dispense two 9.38" diameter x 3.8" wide tissue rolls. Sliding door at bottom to access new roll. Tear-fit bars on both sides of the dispenser opening and sliding door. Dimensions approx. 20.1" W x 11"H x 6" Deep. Approved Brand: Kimberly Clark 9608 or equal.	\$ 5.38	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 64.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-12	SOAP, Hand, Aero Green - Light-green, foam lotion soap with a mild scent. It is 99.99% effective against most common bacteria. Suitable for healthcare, hospitality, and food preparation industries. DEB Aero Green Foam soap provides over 1,400 handwashings per cartridge. Approved Brand: Aero Green 57250	\$ 43.25	\$12.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.07	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.98	\$ 43.25	No Bid	\$ 31.54	No Bid
#0-13	SOAP, Hand Soap Dispenser - Wall mount, traditional box, white ADA, for use with Aero Green 57250 Soap. Approved Brand: Proline ADA 91341	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
#0-14	SANITARY NAPKIN RECEPTACLE - Floor model fits under stall divider. Serves two stalls with double swinging spring-closing push-doors on full-length piano hinges. Stainless Steel Finish with galvanized inner liners. Approx. size 9w x 3d x 11 1/2 h. Approved Brand: Hospeco 2201 or equal.	\$ 17.75	\$17.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.67	\$ 29.61	No Bid	\$ 18.28	\$ 20.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.98	No Bid	\$ 17.75	No Bid	\$ 26.59	No Bid	\$ 17.78	No Bid	\$ 30.80	No Bid

Tabulation for RFP# 1482-Custodial Supplies and Related Items

Bid Line No.	Item	Selected	Lowest	All American Poly	American Pride Paper and Plastic	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	Byrne Brothers, Inc.	Complete Supply Inc	Ecolab Inc.	Empire Paper	Evolve Pro Solutions, Inc	GTE Holdings, LLC	Interboro Packaging Corporation	John M Baxter Sales	Matera Paper Company	Olmsted Kirk Equipment & Supply Co.	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	Pollock Paper Distributors	Prime Source	Safeway Supply, Inc	School Specialty Inc	Staples Business Advantage	Supplyworks	Veritiv Operating Company	Wedge Supply, LLC	Western BRW Paper Company
#0-15	PAPER TOWEL ROLLS - Non-perforated, Hard roll, Natural. Size 7-7/8"x600". Packed 12 rolls per case. Approved Brand: SCA Mainstreet RK350A, Cascades 101757 or Equal.	\$ 14.63	\$14.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.04	\$ 24.44	No Bid	\$ 14.63	\$ 24.20	\$ 23.51	No Bid	\$ 15.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.08	\$ 28.75	\$ 29.50	No Bid	\$ 33.54	\$ 16.67	\$ 15.16	\$ 23.39	\$ 24.30
#0-16	TOILET TISSUE JR. ROLL - JRT Jr. Bathroom Tissue: Soft, Two-ply, biodegradable, white Jr. Roll 3.78" W x 1150' L. Must meet EPA guidelines for post-consumer waste. Have a minimum 45% post-consumer recycled waste; elemental chlorine-free (ECF) bleaching. Approved Brand: Scott-Kimberly Clark 07006 or equal.	\$ 22.97	\$22.74	No Bid	\$ 24.98	\$ 58.99	\$ 39.73	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.38	\$ 42.02	\$ 22.97	No Bid	\$ 22.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.84	No Bid	\$ 29.90	\$ 55.35	\$ 38.20	\$ 36.05	No Bid	\$ 24.60	No Bid
#0-17	VOMIT ABSORBENT - Powder in 16 oz. Shaker style container. Used to absorb vomit, blood, urine and other spills. Quat and micro-biocide to eliminate odors. APPROVED BRAND: Fresh 6-1455, Hospesco 8160 or equal.	\$ 29.96	\$29.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 42.77	\$ 32.41	No Bid	\$ 30.16	\$ 47.29	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.59	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 38.98	No Bid	\$ 40.00	\$ 43.50	\$ 54.35	No Bid	\$ 41.12	No Bid	\$ 29.96	\$ 119.14
#0-18	PAD - 14" White, round Scrubbing Pad. Packed 5 per case.	\$ 6.04	\$ 6.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.15	\$ 7.94	No Bid	\$ 7.67	\$ 8.09	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.04	No Bid	\$ 6.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.95	No Bid	\$ 6.73	No Bid
#0-19	FLOOR, Tile Floor Finish Stripper - 5 ltr bottle ready to dispense, highly-concentrated low-odor floor stripper not formulated with ammonia or butyl Amber in color with solvent scent. Approved Brand: ProStrip SC, Mfg. # 5547312.	\$ 81.90	\$13.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70.38	\$ 13.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 91.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.84	\$ 81.90	No Bid	\$ 34.71	No Bid
#0-20	FLOOR, Finish - Ready-to-use, high shine acrylic floor finish. Approved Brand: Diversy Care Signature Ultra High Speed Floor Finish Mfg. # 5104950.	\$ 69.70	\$13.87	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 65.85	\$ 55.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 69.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.01	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.87	\$ 52.70	\$ 69.70	No Bid	\$ 19.11	No Bid
#0-21	FLOOR, Cleaner & Sealer concrete - High gloss, leveling and long-lasting durable sealer/finisher. Approved Brand: Diversy Care Plaza Hard Surface Sealer/Finish Mfg# 5104933	\$ 70.88	\$39.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 73.65	\$ 44.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 67.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 106.44	\$ 70.88	No Bid	\$ 39.66	No Bid
#0-22	GUM REMOVING COMPOUND - Product shall contain a rapidly evaporating solvent which will freeze gum, wax and tar) on contact and allow them to be removed by physical action. Must not damage fabrics or cause color fading. Product shall contain no butyl solvents, no9nbiodegradable (e.g. fluorinated) surfactants, halogenated solvents. Packed 1/22 oz. Labels must comply with OSHA standards. Approved Brand: Chase 433-4107 or Equal.	\$ 1.80	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.30	\$ 6.25	\$ 32.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.83	\$ -	\$ 1.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.72	No Bid	\$ 1.60	No Bid
#0-23	CLEANER, Baseboard Finish Remover (12/cs) - 20 oz Aerosol, high powered foraming stripper that removes industrial soils and adhesives. Approved Brand: Spartan ShineLine Baseboard & Wax Build-Up Stripper Mfg. # 609700	\$ -	\$23.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.90	No Bid	\$ 28.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.89	No Bid	\$ 23.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.92	\$ 30.87	\$ 23.30	No Bid
#0-24	GRAFFITI REMOVER: For all types of indoor and outdoor (Brick, terrazzo and concrete) surfaces. Must be able to remove; Pencil, Ink, White Out, Permanent Marker, Lipstick, Nail Polish. Must be safe to use in small spaces. Biodegradable and Non-FC's aerosol can or spray bottle. Packed 32 oz container.	\$ 57.66	\$ 2.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 57.66	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.97	\$ 35.72	No Bid
#0-25	BOTTLE 32 OZ. - For portioning assorted cleaning supplies. Color natural; Material HDPE; Neck Finish 28/400. Packed 100 to a case. Approved Brand: Continental 932CG or equal.	\$ 0.38	\$ 0.38	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.89	\$ 0.43	\$ 0.41	No Bid	\$ 0.47	\$ 0.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.38	No Bid	\$ 0.42	No Bid	\$ 0.47	No Bid	\$ 0.39	No Bid	\$ 0.42	No Bid
#0-26	TRIGGER SPRAYER - To be used with Item 230520 bottle. Tube 9 - 1/4". Packed 200 per case. Approved Brand: Continental 922HC, Tolco 110231 or equal.	\$ 0.36	\$ 0.31	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.45	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.40	No Bid	\$ 0.31	\$ 0.43	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.36	No Bid	\$ 0.38	No Bid	\$ 0.37	No Bid	\$ 0.38	\$ 0.55	\$ 0.36	No Bid
#0-27	BUCKET WRINGER COMBO - 44qt. Molded plastic bucket, ribbed at corners. Four non-marking, swivel casters 3" diameter, ball bearing swivel. Side pressure wringer. Foot Pedal Bucket Drain for easy emptying. Approved Brand: Rubbermaid RCP6186-88 yel; or Equal.	\$ 59.00	\$59.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 59.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 69.26	\$ 62.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 63.98	\$ 118.82	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 194.97	No Bid	\$ 61.57	\$ 165.36	No Bid	No Bid
#0-28	BUCKET DUAL WATER MOP, WRINGER COMBO - 35qt. Molded plastic bucket, ribbed at corners. Four non-marking, swivel casters 3" diameter, ball bearing swivel. Side pressure wringer. Foot Pedal Bucket Drain for easy emptying. App-rov-ed Item: Rubbermaid Commercial WaveBrake Mop Bucket with Side Press Wringer FG768000YEL	\$ 37.00	\$37.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 37.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 142.31	\$ 41.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 159.98	\$ 170.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 116.77	\$ 70.95	No Bid	No Bid
#0-29	BUCKET - 10 quarts with spout. Approx. Dimensions: Height 11 1/4" by 12" Diameter. Inside graduation markings for accurate measuring. Approved Brand: Continental 8114, - Rubbermaid 2963 or Equal.	\$ 2.10	\$ 2.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.99	\$ 2.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.38	\$ 2.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.89	\$ 6.69	\$ 4.60	No Bid	\$ 12.01	No Bid	\$ 2.11	No Bid	\$ 6.84	No Bid
#0-30	OVERSHOES - Protective rubber, to fit men's sized 9 1/2 to 11. Must cover entire foot and shoe including shoelaces. Must have gripper sole to prevent falls in wet areas. Approved Brand: Rainfar 898100-3PB11, Talon Trax 3XE84 or Equal.	Eliminated	\$23.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.75	No Bid	\$ 33.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.63	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-31	OVERSHOES - Protective rubber, to fit men's sized Medium. Must cover entire foot and shoe including shoelaces. Must have gripper sole to prevent falls in wet areas. Approved Brand: Rainfar 898100-3PB12XL, Talon Trax3XE85 or Equal.	Eliminated	\$23.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.75	No Bid	\$ 33.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 37.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Tabulation for RFP# 1482-Custodial Supplies and Related Items

Bid Line No.	Item	Selected	Lowest	All American Poly	American Pride Paper and Plastic	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	Byrne Brothers Foods, Inc.	Complete Supply Inc	Ecolab Inc.	Empire Paper	Evolve Pro Solutions, Inc.	GTE Holdings, LLC	Interboro Packaging Corporation	John M Baxter Sales	Matera Paper Company	Olmsted Kirk Equipment & Supply Co.	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	Pollock Paper Distributors	Prime Source	Safeway Supply, Inc	School Specialty Inc	Staples Business Advantage	Supplyworks	Veritiv Operating Company	Wedge Supply, LLC	Western BRW Paper Company	
#0-32	LOBBY DUST PAN - Plastic. Dust pan to swing on handle and locks upright when moving or storing. Approved Brand: IMPACT 2600-S or Equal.	\$ 7.37	\$ 5.79	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.79	\$ 8.17	\$ 7.75	No Bid	\$ 19.09	No Bid	\$ 6.69	\$ 8.82	\$ 7.67	No Bid	
#0-33	BROOM, LOBBY - To go with lobby dust pan. Black block, black washable sanitary PET fringed bristles, 33" x 13/16" black metal handle with swivel hang cap. Sweeping surface, 3-1/4" long fiber. Approved Brand: NexStep 6208 or equal.	\$ 2.04	\$ 1.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.98	\$ 5.08	\$ 1.85	No Bid	\$ 7.36	No Bid	\$ 2.11	\$ 6.61	\$ 2.98	No Bid	
#0-34	WET FLOOR CONE - Molded plastic cone, 37" tall, yellow with red and black lettering in both Spanish and English. Must meet OSHA standards. Weather resistant material will not rust or fade. 4 sided with rounded corners and stackable. To be used with barrier chains. Packed 6 per case. Approved Brand: Rubbermaid 6276-77; or Equal.	Eliminated	\$12.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.54	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.75	\$ 13.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
#0-35	CHAIN, FOR USE WITH FLOOR SIGN (20 FT.)	Eliminated	\$17.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.83	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-36	WET FLOOR CONE - Molded plastic cone, 37" tall, yellow with red and black lettering in both Spanish and English. Must meet OSHA standards. Weather resistant material will not rust or fade. 4 sided with rounded corners and stackable. Packed 6 per case. Approved Brand: Rubbermaid FG611477YEL or equal	\$ 10.97	\$10.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.97	\$ 12.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-37	SCRAPER - 1 1/4" Flexible steel blade. Nylon handle must have a hole for hanging. Overall approx. length 3 1/2". Approved Brand: Stanley#1ARX9, Red Devil 4701 or Equal.	\$ 1.86	\$ 0.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.21	No Bid	
#0-38	SCRAPER - 12" aluminum handle. Compartment in handle to store five 4" wide blades. 4" wide head with blade. Approved Brand: Unger SH00C or Equal.	\$ 11.20	\$ 6.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.99	No Bid	\$ 8.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.81	No Bid	\$ 10.03	No Bid	
#0-39	SCRAPER BLADES - Replacement blades for Unger RB10C. Packed 100 to a box.	\$ 4.48	\$ 4.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 60.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.99	No Bid	\$ 45.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.48	No Bid	\$ 5.42	No Bid	
#0-40	GRABBER, 32" SQUEEZE TRASH - Made of strong lightweight aluminum for indoor and outdoor use. Precise enough to pick up a dime. Rotating strong polycarbonate jaws that can lift 5 pounds in weight. Ergonomic, comfortable grip, and non-slip textured tips. Approved Brand PkStik Pro Grabber	\$ 19.47	\$10.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.59	No Bid	\$ 30.38	No Bid	\$ 20.24	No Bid	
#0-41	BOWL BRUSH - 14-1/2" White; Round Bowl Brush. Approved Brand: Rubbermaid RCP6310 or Equal.	\$ 0.46	\$ 0.46	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.99	\$ 0.49	\$ 2.18	No Bid	\$ 2.26	\$ 0.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.96	No Bid	\$ 0.46	No Bid	\$ 1.33	No Bid	
#0-42	SCRUBBING PADS - Green fibrous pad, approx. 9" x 6" x 1/4. Packed 6/10 count. Approved Brand: ACS S096 - ETC 96 - Lagasse S196 - 3M 96, or Equal.	\$ 0.19	\$ 0.19	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.85	\$ 0.28	No Bid	\$ 5.02	\$ 10.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.36	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.19	\$ 27.00	\$ 3.00	No Bid	\$ 0.62	No Bid	\$ 0.19	No Bid	\$ 12.40	No Bid	
#0-43	FILTER BAGS - Paper, triple layered Micro filtration bag. Must fit a Windsor S12 machine. Packed 1pkg/10 count. Approved Brand: Windsor 1509001 Part # 5300 or Equal.	\$ 6.38	\$ 6.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.88	No Bid	\$ 11.06	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
#0-44	SCREEN DISKS - 19" x 120 grt. Screen consists of a circular piece of fibrous screening material, for use on wood gym floor surfaces. Packed 10 per case.	\$ 66.10	\$30.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.57	\$ 40.24	No Bid	\$ 40.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.98	\$ 80.16	\$ 40.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.10	No Bid	\$ 30.27	No Bid	
#0-45	SCREEN DISKS - 19" x 100 grt. Screen consists of a circular piece of fibrous screening material, for use on wood gym floor surfaces. Packed 20 per case. Approved Brand: SSS 19100, or equal.	\$ 93.00	\$32.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 38.15	\$ 43.04	No Bid	\$ 84.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.75	\$ 93.00	\$ 47.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 150.20	No Bid	\$ 32.28	No Bid	
#0-46	BURNISHING PAD - 20" White Round shaped High Speed Burnish Pad; Natural Hair (with Hog hair). Packed 5 per case. Approved Brand: ACS 33-20, or Equal.	\$ 9.89	\$ 9.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.95	\$ 11.20	\$ 14.26	No Bid	\$ 11.16	\$ 12.31	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.35	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.89	\$ 17.45	\$ 9.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.60	No Bid	\$ 11.31	No Bid	
#0-47	PAD - 12" White Floor Scrubber Maintenance Pad. Packed 5 per case. Approved Brand: Norton 176; ACS 41-12 or Equal.	\$ 7.45	\$ 4.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.65	\$ 6.33	No Bid	\$ 5.20	\$ 6.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.67	\$ 7.45	\$ 5.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.35	No Bid	\$ 5.37	No Bid	
#0-48	PAD - 13" Red. Floor Scrubber Maintenance Pad. Packed 5 per case. Approved Brand: ACS S1-13, Norton 54272 or Equal.	\$ 8.45	\$ 5.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.20	\$ 6.92	No Bid	\$ 5.90	\$ 7.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.26	\$ 8.45	\$ 5.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.15	No Bid	\$ 5.87	No Bid	
#0-49	PAD - 20" Black. Floor Scrubber Maintenance Pad. Packed 5 per case. Approved Brand: 3M 7200, ACS 72-20, Norton 54230 or equal.	\$ 16.85	\$ 9.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.20	\$ 13.16	No Bid	\$ 11.16	\$ 12.33	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.93	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.89	\$ 16.85	\$ 9.00	No Bid	\$ 36.54	No Bid	\$ 11.85	No Bid	\$ 11.17	No Bid	
#0-50	PAD - 20" Purple Burnishing Pad. Packed 5 per box.	Eliminated	\$ 9.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 195.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.89	\$ 190.25	\$ 9.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 176.38	\$ 11.38	No Bid	
#0-51	PAD - 27" - Lite Natural Hog Hair/Diamond Floor Maintenance Pad. Packed 2 per box.	\$ 28.10	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 181.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.94	\$ 28.10	\$ 21.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.03	\$ 25.52	No Bid	
#0-52	MOP - Medium; Commercial Grade; 4 ply rayon/synthetic blend Micro-fiber; Loop-end; Launderable; no fraying, raveling or tangled ends. 1-1/4" narrow band; Tailband to allow mop to cover more floor. Mop must meet today's "GREEN" standard. Approved Brand: NexStep 97312	\$ 51.84	\$ 6.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 42.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 47.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.84	No Bid	\$ 51.84	\$ 6.67	

Tabulation for RFP# 1482-Custodial Supplies and Related Items

Bid Line No.	Item	Selected	Lowest	All American Poly	American Pride Paper and Plastic	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	Byrne Brothers Foods, Inc.	Complete Supply Inc	Ecolab Inc.	Empire Paper	Evolve Pro Solutions, Inc.	GTE Holdings, LLC	Interboro Packaging Corporation	John M Baxter Sales	Matera Paper Company	Olmsted Kirk Equipment & Supply Co.	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	Pollock Paper Distributors	Prime Source	Safeway Supply, Inc	School Specialty Inc	Staples Business Advantage	Supplyworks	Veritiv Operating Company	Wedge Supply, LLC	Western BRW Paper Company
#0-53	MOP - Large; Commercial Grade; 4 ply rayon/synthetic blend Micro-fiber; Loop-end; Launderable; no fraying, raveling or tangled ends. 1-1/4" narrow band; Tailband to allow mop to cover more floor. Mop must meet today's "GREEN" standard. Approved Brand: NexStep 97313	\$ 64.32	\$ 8.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 61.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 55.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.24	No Bid	\$ 64.32	\$ 8.65
#0-54	MOP HANDLE - Injection molded 7-5/8" wide-head, fiberglass shaft, non-marring plastic head, 1" diameter x 64" long, orange. Approved Brand Impact 84.	\$ 11.92	\$ 5.51	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.65	No Bid	\$ 11.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.89	No Bid	\$ 12.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.03	\$ 5.51	\$ 11.08	No Bid
#0-55	DUSTER POLYWOOL 20" - Synthetic duster to attract dust via static electricity. Flexible heads, washable. Mounted on plastic handle 20" overall length, with hanger holes. Color Assorted. Packed 24 per case. Approved Brand: TFX9441, Lambskin Specialties S24PPD or equal.	\$ 1.89	\$ 1.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.24	No Bid	\$ 4.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.19	No Bid	\$ 2.25	No Bid	\$ 2.33	No Bid	\$ 3.71	No Bid	\$ 1.89	No Bid
#0-56	DUSTER POLYWOOL W/ EXTENSION HANDLE - Synthetic duster to attract dust via static electricity. Flexible heads, washable. Mounted on metal extendable handle witch extends S1" to 82", with hanger holes. Color Assorted. Packed 10 per case. Approved Brand: O'Cedar 96482, Lambskin S82EPPD or equal.	\$ 4.14	\$ 4.14	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.99	No Bid	\$ 9.39	No Bid	\$ 6.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.39	No Bid	\$ 4.75	No Bid	\$ 5.16	No Bid	\$ 4.14	No Bid	\$ 4.22	No Bid
#0-57	DUST MOP HEAD 24" - Both fringe and center section are constructed of 100% microfiber, double sewn edge, slip-on slot fits standard 5" dust mop frames, no linting, highly launderable, quick-dry synthetic backing. Approved Brand: NexStep 96072.	\$ 6.39	\$ 3.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.45	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.99	No Bid	\$ 6.45	\$ 15.43	\$ 6.39	\$ 6.83
#0-58	DUST MOP HEAD 48" - Both fringe and center section are constructed of 100% microfiber, double sewn edge, slip-on slot fits standard 5" dust mop frames, no linting, highly launderable, quick-dry synthetic backing. Approved Brand: NexStep 96076.	\$ 10.76	\$ 4.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.74	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.52	\$ 20.95	\$ 10.76	\$ 12.39
#0-59	DUST MOP HEAD 60" - Both fringe and center section are constructed of 100% microfiber, double sewn edge, slip-on slot fits standard 5" dust mop frames, no linting, highly launderable, quick-dry synthetic backing. Approved Brand: NexStep 96078.	\$ 13.45	\$ 6.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.38	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.09	\$ 9.92	\$ 13.45	\$ 16.92
#0-60	DUST MOP HANDLE 60" - Clip-on handle, 12 gauge zinc plated steel hardware. 360 degree swivel head with sliding nylon lock. Double lacquered ramin wood handle. Packed 12 count. Approved Brand: Lagasse 1490, ABCO-01406-NB: or Equal.	\$ 4.08	\$ 3.43	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.17	\$ 4.08	\$ 9.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.18	No Bid	\$ 4.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.43	\$ 9.92	\$ 4.62	No Bid
#0-61	FRAME, Dust Mop 24" - Rust resistant metal frame. Approved Brand: ABCO - BH 24524.	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.05	\$ 2.49	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.92	No Bid	\$ 1.85	No Bid	\$ 3.44	No Bid	\$ 1.75	No Bid	\$ 1.86	No Bid
#0-62	FRAME, Dust Mop 48" - Rust resistant metal frame. Approved Brand: ABCO - BH24548.	\$ 2.59	\$ 2.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.10	\$ 3.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.07	No Bid	\$ 3.10	No Bid	\$ 5.60	No Bid	\$ 2.59	No Bid	\$ 3.37	No Bid
#0-63	FRAME, Dust Mop 60" - Rust resistant metal frame. Approved Brand: Golden Star GST-FQC60.	\$ 2.50	\$ 2.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.00	\$ 8.93	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.19	No Bid	\$ 4.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.50	No Bid	\$ 5.44	No Bid
#0-64	DOODLEBUG - Plastic holder with Velcro base. Dimensions 4 5/8 x 10". Holder swivels in all directions and is threaded to fit any standard threaded handle. Packed 12 per case. Approved Brand: 3M 6472, Premier 405, Tolco 28D137, O'Cedar 93150 or Equal.	\$ 3.69	\$ 3.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.15	\$ 4.21	No Bid	\$ 13.44	\$ 4.43	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.69	No Bid	\$ 4.05	No Bid
#0-65	DOODLEBUG Pad-Extra Heavy-duty "black" cleaning pad. Dimensions 4 5/8 x 10". Packed 10 count. Approved Brand: 3M 8550, ACS 672; or Equal.	\$ 2.78	\$ 2.78	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.25	\$ 29.53	No Bid	\$ 25.40	\$ 5.94	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.78	No Bid	\$ 4.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.86	No Bid	\$ 10.64	No Bid
#0-66	DOODLEBUG HANDLE - Fiberglass with standard threaded end. 1" dia. X 60" long. Handle is mesh-velled to prevent splintering. Packed 12 count. Approved Brand: ABCO 01115, O'Cedar 97360, Wlien M117060 or equal.	\$ 2.23	\$ 2.23	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.86	\$ 10.73	No Bid	\$ 7.40	\$ 89.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.99	No Bid	\$ 5.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.23	No Bid	\$ 4.86	No Bid
#0-67	DUST CLOTH - 24" x 24". Packed 4/50 count. Approved Brand: IFC 460, Mercantile Dev 79112, Hospeco M-N6119H or Equal.	\$ 6.35	\$ 6.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 64.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.99	\$ 65.00	\$ 6.35	\$ 38.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
#0-68	TERRY CLOTH WIPES - New; Re-usable white terry cloth. Assorted sizes. Packed 25 lb. Approved Brand: Dallas Wiping T1720, Hospeco 53425 or equal.	\$ 4.41	\$ 4.41	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 37.50	\$ 19.50	No Bid	\$ 4.41	\$ 41.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.95	No Bid	\$ 36.00	\$ 14.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.60	No Bid	\$ 45.80	No Bid
#0-69	DISPOSABLE TOWELS - Approx. 13 1/4" x 21" Foodservice Towel, cloth with Micro ban anti-microbial protection. Virgin rayon, aperture engineered and MEF process for low-linting. Packed 150 to a case. Approved Brand: Chicopee 8251 blue, Dynamax by Kimberly Clark 29421, Hospeco FS-NB220; Atlantic Mills 8570A or Equal.	\$ 14.25	\$14.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.70	\$ 23.00	No Bid	\$ 24.45	\$ 14.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.98	No Bid	\$ 14.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 19.44	No Bid
#0-70	FACIAL TISSUE - 2 ply Tissue, SOFT, White. Must dispense one tissue at a time; dimensions approximately 7.5in x 9 in. For use in school clinic. Packed 100 tissue per box/ 30 boxes per case. Approved Brand: Surpass 21340, Boardwalk 6500; Atlantis 1867; affex AFX-F1100 or equal.	\$ 0.46	\$ 0.46	No Bid	\$ 0.46	\$ 2.30	\$ 0.72	\$ 0.57	No Bid	\$ 15.95	\$ 0.76	\$ 13.60	No Bid	\$ 0.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.79	\$ 0.74	\$ 0.52	\$ 0.65	\$ 19.24	No Bid	\$ 19.45	No Bid	\$ 15.60	\$ 14.56

Tabulation for RFP# 1482-Custodial Supplies and Related Items

Bid Line No.	Item	Selected	Lowest	All American Poly	American Pride Paper and Plastic	Anchorage Medical Equipment & Supplies, LLC	Byrne Brothers Foods, Inc.	Complete Supply Inc	Ecolab Inc.	Empire Paper	Evolve Pro Solutions, Inc.	GTE Holdings, LLC	Interboro Packaging Corporation	John M Baxter Sales	Matera Paper Company	Olmsted Kirk Equipment & Supply Co.	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	Pollock Paper Distributors	Prime Source	Safeway Supply, Inc	School Specialty Inc	Staples Business Advantage	Supplyworks	Veritiv Operating Company	Wedge Supply, LLC	Western BRW Paper Company
#0-71	GLOVES - Disposable, Thickness: 6mil; Rolled Cuff; Industrial Grade; Powder-free nitrile; puncture & abrasion resistant. Color Black. Size Medium. Packed 100 to a box. Approved Brand: SAS Safety Corp. Astro Grip Nitrile - Medium 66517	\$ 8.00	\$ 3.76	No Bid	\$ 3.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.76	No Bid	\$ 4.08	\$ 4.21	No Bid	\$ 3.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.49	No Bid	\$ 8.00	\$ 5.98	\$ 10.95	No Bid	\$ 7.60	\$ 5.40	\$ 55.06	\$ 5.94
#0-72	GLOVES - Disposable, Thickness: 6mil; Rolled Cuff; Industrial Grade; Powder-free nitrile; puncture & abrasion resistant. Color Black. Size Large. Packed 100 to a box. Approved Brand: SAS Safety Corp. Astro Grip Nitrile - Large 66518	\$ 8.00	\$ 3.76	No Bid	\$ 3.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.76	No Bid	\$ 4.08	\$ 4.21	No Bid	\$ 3.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.49	No Bid	\$ 8.00	\$ 5.98	\$ 10.95	No Bid	\$ 7.60	\$ 6.61	\$ 55.06	\$ 5.94
#0-73	GLOVES - Disposable, Thickness: 6mil; Rolled Cuff; Industrial Grade; Powder-free nitrile; puncture & abrasion resistant. Color Black. Size XLarge. Packed 100 to a box. Approved Brand: SAS Safety Corp. Astro Grip Nitrile - XLarge 66519	\$ 8.00	\$ 3.76	No Bid	\$ 3.89	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.76	No Bid	\$ 4.08	\$ 4.21	No Bid	\$ 3.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.49	No Bid	\$ 8.00	\$ 5.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.60	\$ 4.41	\$ 55.06	\$ 5.94
#0-74	BUCKET, 18 qtr. Nesting bucket that fits below wringer on Rubbermaid Wavebrake mop buckets. Made of highly-durable, web-molded plastic, RED. Approved Brand: Rubbermaid # F69C7400RED	\$ 9.90	\$ 9.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.90	\$ 24.33	No Bid	\$ 10.73	\$ 11.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.13	\$ 72.76	No Bid	No Bid
#0-75	White Nuisance Dust Mask with Adjustable Metal Nose Band and Latex Free Elastic Strap. 50/Box Approved Brand: The Safety Zone # RS-810	\$ 3.27	\$ 3.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.95	\$ 4.65	No Bid	\$ 4.38	\$ 21.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.05	No Bid	\$ 3.56	No Bid	\$ 3.27	No Bid
#0-76	MASK, Earloop face mask. 50/carton	\$ 4.81	\$ 1.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.99	\$ 5.80	\$ 8.45	No Bid	\$ 8.70	\$ 6.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.60	\$ 9.00	No Bid	\$ 4.81	No Bid	\$ 28.27	No Bid
#0-77	PAD - 20" Brown Surface Preparation Pad (SPP) (505mm, 10/Box) Approved Brand: Scotch-Brite SPP20	\$ 84.87	\$20.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.05	\$ 76.47	No Bid	\$ 77.85	\$ 24.39	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.87	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.99	No Bid	\$ 40.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 79.10	\$ 77.17	\$ 40.76	No Bid

Eliminated: Tiles In Style LLC (DBA) Taza Supplies
 Invites: 223
 Submissions: 23